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TRANSLATED FROM THE RUSSIAN BY THOMAS B.

RareBooksClub. Paperback. Book Condition: New. This item is printed on demand. Paperback. 20 pages.
Original publisher: Washington, D. C. : Federal Aviation Administration, 2005. OCLC Number: (OCoLC)256465176
Subject: Aviation medicine -- Management. Excerpt: . . . 9 22 05 AC 00-64 c. Recurrent Practice and Feedback.
AMRM training should be included as a regular part of recurrent training. Recurrent AMRM training should
include refresher practice and feedback exercises. Advanced AMRM components may be introduced as the air
medical team grows and develops comprehensive use of AMRM principles. Recurrent training allows
participants to practice newly improved skills in communication and interpersonal relationships and to receive
feedback on their eDectiveness. Feedback has its greatest impact when it comes by way of self-critique and peer
review. Feedback in a debriefing environment should focus on the action not the individual. Guidance from a
facilitator with special training in assessment and debriefing techniques completes an eDective practice
feedback process. d. Continuing Reinforcement. AMRM concepts should be carried into every other type of
training including technical and interdepartmental training so that those concepts are reinforced continuously.
Dissimilar groups should all be brought together for joint AMRM training. The objective is to improve the
eDectiveness and safety of the entire operations team ( cross-pollination ) as a working system. This is
accomplished through: ( 1 ) Technical Training ( e. g. , initial and recurrent training ) which includes: ( a )
Simulation. Simulation training provides all team members a better opportunity to understand other team
members responsibilities and job function. Simulations that could be used for training could include a mock air
medical flight to emergency room staD and dispatchers or providing training on the helicopter emergency
systems and procedures to the medical flight crewmembers. This could be something as simple as how to turn
off...
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Christian World Imprints/B.R. Publishing Corporation, New Delhi, India, 2014. Hardcover.
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Createspace, United States, 2013. Paperback. Book Condition: New. 214 x 149 mm. Language:
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